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NOTICE OF A CLAIM UNDER SECTION 47A OF THE COMPETITION ACT 1998 
Case No: 1688/5/7/24 

 
Pursuant to Rule 33(8) of the Competition Appeal Tribunal Rules 2015 (S.I. 2015 No. 1648) (the “Tribunal 
Rules”), the Registrar gives notice of the receipt of a claim for damages (the “Claim”) on 1 October 2024, 
under section 47A of the Competition Act 1998 (the “Act”), by Instaplanta (Yorkshire) Limited (the 
“Claimant” / “Instaplanta”) against Leeds City Council (the “Defendant” / “LCC”). The Claimant is 
represented by TupperS Law Limited, 22 Disraeli Road, Ealing, London W5 5HP (Reference: Stephen 
Tupper). 
 
The Claimant is a micro business based in Leeds, West Yorkshire, which principally provides horticultural 
timber products to the care, education, and local authority sectors and more specifically provides 
environmentally friendly roadside advertising space through the supply, installation, and maintenance of 
timber floral planters within the limits of the highways of North England. 
 
The Defendant is the administrative authority for the City of Leeds in West Yorkshire, England. It is a 
metropolitan district council, one of five in West Yorkshire and one of 36 in the metropolitan counties of 
England. It provides the majority of local government services in Leeds. The Leeds Metropolitan District 
covers 552 square kilometres and is the second largest metropolitan district in England. 
 
According to the claim form, LCC, like many local authorities, is an active commercial participant in the 
market for supply of environmentally friendly roadside advertising space (referred to as “Green Roadside 
Advertising”) in the Leeds metropolitan market.  
 
In addition to being the largest single provider of Green Roadside Advertising space in the Leeds metropolitan 
area, LCC is also the statutory highways body charged with regulating roadside enhancements in line with 
national legislation.  
 
The Claimant is required to apply to LCC for permission to install objects or structures in or over a highway 
as a precursor to installation, and LCC is the sole relevant permitting authority for such installations in Leeds. 
The Claimant’s position is that this function means that LCC is the de facto “gatekeeper” to the Green Roadside 
Advertising market in Leeds; LCC is an unavoidable intermediary for those looking to enter into this market. 
 
LCC is also the largest active participant in the Green Roadside Advertising market in Leeds and the Claimant 
estimates that LCC has over 80% of this market. 
 
The Claimant issued proceedings against the Defendant in the Competition Appeal Tribunal (the “Tribunal”) 
on 22 November 2022 (Case 1569/5/7/22: Instaplanta (Yorkshire) Limited v Leeds City Council (the “First 
Action”)). The summary of the claim in the First Action is available on the Tribunal’s website: 1569/5/7/22 
Instaplanta (Yorkshire) Limited v Leeds City Council - Summary of claim | 23 Jan 2022 (catribunal.org.uk). 
The parties agreed terms and subsequently, the First Action was withdrawn by the Claimant by consent on 14 
August 2023 with no order as to costs. 
 
By way of an email dated 26 September 2023, shortly after the resolution of the First Action, Instaplanta 
contacted LCC to determine whether LCC would be prepared to meet in advance of Instaplanta making an 
application for a licence to site planters. According to the claim form, LCC declined to engage.  
 
 
 



Charles Dhanowa OBE, KC (Hon) 


